
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒú 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 1

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Stamp Act.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Stamp
Act for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the
Seventy-second Year of the Republic of India, as follows:—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Stamp (Amendment) Act,
2021.

2. In SCHEDULE I appended to the Maharashetra Stamp Act,—

(1) in article 6,—

(a) in clause (1), in sub-clause (b), in column (2),—

(i) for the words “ten lakh rupees” the words “twenty lakh
rupees” shall be substituted;

Short title.

Amendment of
SCHEDULE I
of LX of 1958.

LX of
1958.

LX of
1958.

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the following translation in English of the Maharashtra Stamp (Amendment)
Act, 2021 (Mah. Act No. VII of 2022), is hereby published under the authority
of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VII OF 2022.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 20th January 2022).

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 8, +ÆEòú 2(5)] MÉÖ°ü´ÉÉ®ú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 4, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 7

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀--7----1

(1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒú 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943

(ii) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:–

“Provided that, in case of instrument executed in favour
of consortium of banks, the duty chargeable shall not exceed
fifty lakh rupees.”;

(b) in clause (2), in sub-clause (b), in column (2),—

(i) for the words “ten lakh rupees” the words “twenty lakh
rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:–

“Provided that, in case of instrument executed in favour
of consortium of banks, the duty chargeable shall not exceed
fifty lakh rupees.”;

(2) in article 33, in clause (b), for sub-clause (ii), the following sub-
clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(ii) if possession is not so given,–

(A) if the amount of further 0.1 per cent. of the amount of
charge secured by such deed further charge secured by such
does not exceed rupees deed, subject to minimum of one
five lakhs, hundred rupees;

(B) in any other case, 0.3 per cent. of the amount of
further charge secured by such
deed, subject to maximum of
twenty lakh rupees.”;

(3) in article 40, in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in column (2),—

(i) for the words “ten lakh rupees” the words “twenty lakh
rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that, in case of instrument executed in favour of
consortium of banks, the duty chargeable shall not exceed fifty lakh
rupees.”;

(4) for article 41, the following article shall be substituted,
namely :–

“41. MORTGAGE OF CROP,
including any instrument
evidencing an agreement to
secure the repayment of a loan
made upon any mortgage of a
crop whether the crop is or is
not in existence at the time
of mortgage,—



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒú 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 3

(i) if the amount secured by 0.1 per cent. of the amount
such deed does not exceed secured by such deed, subject
rupees five lakhs, to the minimum of one

hundred rupees;

(ii) in any other case, 0.3 per cent. of the amount
secured by such deed, subject
to the maximum of twenty
lakh rupees.”;

(5) for article 54, the following article shall be substituted, namely :–

“54. SECURITY BOND OR
MORTGAGE DEED, where
such security bond or mortgage
deed is executed by way of
security for the due execution
of an office, or to account for
money or other property
received by virtue thereof, or
by a surety to secure the due
performance of a contract, or
in pursuance of an order of
the court or a public officer,
not being otherwise provided
for by the Maharashtra
Court-fees Act,—

(i) if the amount secured by 0.1 per cent. of the amount
such deed does not exceed secured by such deed, subject
rupees five lakhs, to the minimum of one hundred

rupees;

(ii) in any other case, 0.3 per cent. of the amount
secured by such deed, subject to
the maximum of twenty lakh
rupees:

Provided that, where on
an instrument executed by a
person for whom a person
stands surety and executes
security bond or a mortgage
deed, duty has been paid under
article 40, then the duty
payable shall be one hundred
rupees.”.

XXXVI
of 1959.



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒú 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943

Exemptions

Bond or other instrument,
when executed,—

(a) by any person for the
purpose of guaranteeing that
the local income derived from
private subscriptions to a
charitable dispensary or
hospital or any other object
of public utility shall not be
less than a specified sum per
mensem ;

(b) under the rules made by
the State Government under
section 114 of the Maharashtra
Irrigation Act, 1976 ;

(c) by a person taking advance
under the Land Improvement
Loans Act, 1883 or the
Agriculturists Loans Act, 1884
or by their sureties as security
for the repayment of such
advances ;

(d) by officers of the Government
or their sureties to secure the due
execution of an office or due
accounting for money or
other property received by
virtue thereof.

 XII of
1884.

Mah.
XXVIII
of 1976.

XIX of
1883.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


